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Precedents
Contemporary 
cohousing models.

Introduction
To complement the projects pre-
sented in the talks by John Mc-
minn, Grace Kim, Crystal Byrd 
Farmer, and Adrian Blackwell, are 
a list of relevant and inspiring built 
cohousing projects.

The following precedents are ex-
amples of cohousing that demon-
strate the realm of collaborative 
living which is concerned with af-
fordability, participatory design, 
community funding, and environ-
mentally conscious designs. 

Not represented in this list are 
examples of “cohousing” that op-
erate as a rental model owned by 
for-profit corporations. 
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Hashtags
Along the side of each project are 
values which guided the develop-
ment and design process of the 
cohousing complex. Included are:

#Small Units

#Shared 
Circulation

#Urban Devel-
opment

#Artist Space

#Condominium#Ownership Model

#Adaptive-
Reuse

#Community 
Organized

#Self-Built

#Rural Develop-
ment

#Low Cost

#Shared De-
sign
#Pedestrian Street

#Green Design#Self Governed

#Market-Rate 
Secured

#Affordability

#Passive House

#Co-Designed 
and Co-Built

#Participatory 
Design



R50 Baugruppen 
Berlin, Germany
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Architects
Co-designed by architects ifau, 
Jesko Fezer, and Heide & von Bec-
kerath

Description
This 19 unit cohousing project was 
initiated by the architects and col-
lectively funded. Designed through 
a participatory planning approach.

View This Project Here:

ArchDaily

ifau Project Phases

Architect Project PDF

Heide & von Beckerath

Metropolis
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https://www.archdaily.com/593154/r50-nil-cohousing-ifau-und-jesko-fezer-heide-and-von-beckerath?fbclid=IwAR3IorLhpZZBliqEFva9HYdsmCXIFCNfoiSiAJ1UPSSaqxI6Pca1-RLhJw0
http://www.ifau.berlin/projects/r50
http://www.ifau.berlin/content/1-projects/16-r50/ifau-fezer-hvb-r50-archplus.pdf
https://heidevonbeckerath.com/single/r50-cohousing
https://www.metropolismag.com/architecture/residential-architecture/dont-call-it-a-commune-inside-berlin-radical-cohousing-project/?fbclid=IwAR3WLY1yh8qqe1yfR2gE4AFN2NNmW_AdXd8MjCf9l_Zv6w_WvFBiA_CMuGw


ChZero 
Pisa, Italy
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Photo of ChZero Terrace



Architects
Co-funded and designed by a group 
of architects and engineers, in-
cluding ATIProject

Description
Built by a group of architects and 
engineers. Four units per floor on 
the first three floors, with a shared 
roof terrace and common space.

View This Project Here:

Dwell

Domus

ATIProject

Case Study PDF
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https://www.dwell.com/article/co-housing-zero-b41a2c48
https://www.domusweb.it/en/Advertorial/2018/05/14/speciale-viessmann/zero-impact-co-housing.html
https://atiproject.com/en/project/cohousing-zero/
https://www.viessmann.it/content/dam/vi-micro/ARCHITEC24/RISCALDAMENTO%20CENTRALIZZATO/COHOUSING-PISA---PI/Cohousing_a_Pisa_Concorso_di_idee_Viessmann_2014.pdf/_jcr_content/renditions/original./Cohousing_a_Pisa_Concorso_di_idee_Viessmann_2014.pdf


Co-living Com-
plex Oosterwold
Almere, Netherlands
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Photo of Oosterwold Unit Interior 

Photo of Oosterwold Exterior 
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Architects
Designed by bureau SLA and 
self-organized and funded.

Description
Nine friends come together to build 
a cohousing development. A 100m 
long bar building leaves a large 
space for the community garden.

View This Project Here:

ArchDaily

Bureau SLA

ENKI Magazine

https://www.archdaily.com/914154/oosterwold-co-living-complex-bureau-sla
https://www.bureausla.nl/project/woningbouw-oosterwold/?lang=en
https://enkimagazine.com/oosterwold-co-living-complex/
http://www.cohousingco.com/mountain-view/


Scarwafa
Amsterdam, Nether-
lands
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Photo of Scarwafa Cohousing



Architects
Designed by krft Architects and 
self-organized. 

Description
Three couples bought three lots 
next to one another and they built a 
cohousing complex together. 

View This Project Here:

ArchDaily

KRFT
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https://www.archdaily.com/914900/scarwafa-co-housing-krft
http://www.krft.nl/project-items/monnikskapstraat
http://www.cohousingco.com/mountain-view/


Silver Sage 
Colorado, US
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Photo of R50 Baugruppen

Photo of R50 Baugruppen



Architects
Designed and planned by McCam-
mant and Durret Architects in col-
laboration with residents.

Description
16 households are built around a 
courtyard. A shared 5000sqft com-
mon house. This is a seniors com-
munity design with aging-in-place 
principles, and the first cohousing 
community in the country.

View This Project Here:

Silver Sage Cohousing

McCammant and Durret Architects
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https://silversagevillage.com/reserve-our-common-house/
http://www.cohousingco.com/silver-sage/xu9jcazdx726s4jf38qeo8j5kgrarc


Mountain View 
California, US
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Photo of Mountain View Gardens



Architects
Designed and planned by McCam-
mant and Durret Architects in col-
laboration with residents.

Description
This 19 unit complex is a cohous-
ing condominium residence. With 
6000+ sq ft of indoor common 
space and 4000+ sq ft of outdoor 
garden space. Includes a repur-
posed 1898 farmhouse.

View This Project Here:

Mountain View Cohousing

McCammant and Durret Architects
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http://mountainviewcohousing.org/
http://www.cohousingco.com/mountain-view/


Vancouver 
Vancouver, Canada
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Photo of Vancouver Cohousing “Street”



Architects
Designed by McCammant and 
Durret Architects with a participa-
tory design approach.

Description
These 29 privately owned houses 
share a 6500+ sq ft common house. 
The Vancouver cohousing complex 
was built in an old city neighbour-
hood.

View This Project Here:

Vancouver Cohousing

McCammant and Durret Architects

Canadian Cohousing Network
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https://www.vancouvercohousing.com/
https://cohousing.ca/communities/bc/vancouver/
https://cohousing.ca/communities/bc/vancouver/
https://cohousing.ca/communities/bc/vancouver/


Radiance Cohousing 
Saskatoon, Canada
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Photo of Radiance Cohousing Interior

Photo of Radiance Cohousing Exterior



Architects
Designed by BLDG Studio, this was 
a collaboratively designed and con-
structed cohousing complex.

Description
This cohousing complex has 9 
units. It was designed to Passive 
House standards and includes 
many sharing features including a 
dedicated car-share.

View This Project Here:

Radiance Cohousing

Dwell

Radiance Cohousing Information 
PDF

Passive House Buildings
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https://www.radiancecohousing.ca/
https://www.dwell.com/collection/radiance-cohousing-faca47ed
https://12a3eb3e-cd8f-6d40-3e64-9471b498e9e8.filesusr.com/ugd/f3525a_f0d265e14d78451290b86180d9d4b008.pdf
https://12a3eb3e-cd8f-6d40-3e64-9471b498e9e8.filesusr.com/ugd/f3525a_f0d265e14d78451290b86180d9d4b008.pdf
http://passivehousebuildings.com/books/phc-2019/radiance-cohousing/


LILAC Cohousing
London, UK
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Photo of LILAC Communal Pond



Architects
Using a participatory design ap-
proach, this community was built 
with the help of Architecture firm 
White Design.

Description
With 20 environmentally conscious 
units, this Leeds development 
is built around shared common 
space, including a common house 
and outdoor space.

View This Project Here:

LILAC (Low Impact Living Afford-
able Community)

The Guardian

Pollard Thomas Edwards

White Design
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https://www.lilac.coop/
https://www.lilac.coop/
https://www.theguardian.com/cities/2014/nov/21/how-to-create-happy-communities-through-co-housing
https://pollardthomasedwards.co.uk/projects/new-ground-cohousing/
https://www.white-design.com/architecture/all-projects/lilac/


OWCH Group
London, UK
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Architects
Pollard Thomas Edwards was the 
architect who worked with the Ha-
nover Housing organization.

Description
With 25 private residences, Older 
Women’s Co-housing is organized 
around a series of communal out-
door spaces. Designed for older 
women the complex is fitted with 
aging-in-place infrastructures.

View This Project Here:

Dezeen

Older Women’s Co-Housing

Pollard Thomas Edwards

“A room of one’s own?” Jakarta 
Post
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https://www.dezeen.com/2016/12/09/pollard-thomas-edwards-architecture-first-older-co-housing-scheme-owch-uk/
https://www.owch.org.uk/
https://pollardthomasedwards.co.uk/projects/new-ground-cohousing/
https://www.thejakartapost.com/life/2020/02/03/a-room-of-ones-own-london-carves-out-spaces-for-women.html
https://www.thejakartapost.com/life/2020/02/03/a-room-of-ones-own-london-carves-out-spaces-for-women.html


Marmalade Lane
London, UK
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Photo of Marmalade Lane Street Front



Architects
Designed by Mole Architects and 
equity-financed by Trivselhus UK. 

Description
Named Marmalade Lane for the 
car-free street down the center of 
the development. The complex has 
42 homes, a mix of two to five bed-
room terraced houses. 

View This Project Here:

ArchDaily

Mole Architects

Marmalade Lane

Architonic
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https://www.archdaily.com/918201/marmalade-lane-cohousing-development-mole-architects
https://www.molearchitects.co.uk/projects/housing/k1-cambridge-co-housing/
https://www.architonic.com/en/project/mole-architects-marmalade-lane-cohousing/20059375


Kankan Mori
Tokyo, Japan
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Photo of Kankan Mori Cohousing



Architects
Construction managed and spatial-
ly designed by Ikuko Koyabe Archi-
tects.

Description
The housing collaborative takes up 
two floors of a twelve-story repur-
posed school building. Contains 26 
apartments and 166m2 of common 
space. 

View This Project Here:

JSTOR

Collective House
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https://www.jstor.org/stable/23290269?seq=14#metadata_info_tab_contents
http://www.collectivehouse.co.jp/


Yokohama 
Yokohama-Shi, Japan
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Photo of Yokahama Apartments

Photo of Yokahama Apartments



Architects
Designed by Erika Nakagawa Ar-
chitects.

Description
A 4 unit wooden structure in an 
unusual site is an artists cohous-
ing complex. The interior court-
yard serves as a studio and gallery 
space for the residents.

View This Project Here:

ArchDaily

Erika Nakagawa
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https://www.archdaily.com/303401/yokohama-apartment-on-design-partners?ad_medium=gallery
http://erikanakagawa.com/enweb.workpage3en.html


Cooperative gar-
den
Tokyo, Japan
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Photo of Cooperative Garden



Architects
Designed by Erika Nakagawa Ar-
chitects.

Description
This 10 unit structure is designed 
over 10 floors with a large commu-
nal staircase. As a high-rise con-
dominium, each unit has access to 
outside space via a deck.

View This Project Here:

Erika Nakagawa Models

Eirka Nakagawa
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http://erikanakagawa.com/enweb.model4.html
http://erikanakagawa.com/enweb.workpage2en.html


Credits
This booklet was created by Vic 
Mantha-Blythe for the University of 
Waterloo 2020 Cohousing Sympo-
sium 


